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Regents consider withdrawal policy
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Marty Trlllhaase
A new, funding plan for the

Kibbie Dome varsity center
addition, changes in the class
withdrawal policy, and
elimination of the distinction
between "residence" and
"extension" courses are
among items seeking approval
from the Board of Regents

. next week.
The regents are scheduled

to meet on the Boise State
University campus Thursday
and Friday.

The U. of I. administration
announced last week that it
was revamping its funding
proposal for the Kibbie Dome
addition. Originally the
project was to have cost
roughly $2.2 million. Of that,
$1.2 million was to have come
from outside sources. The
remaining $ 1 million would
have come from student fee
shifts and portions of a
proposed $10 student fee
increase would have
underwritten operation of the
addition.

But in light of financial
, pressures, some of which are
due to passage of the one

percent initiative, the
administration has revised
funding, calling for a
downscaled $1.7 million cost.
The university is requesting
approval of its plan to solicit
the entire amount from
contributors.

The concept of an addition
to the Kibbie Dome won
narrow student support during
the recent ASUI election. In
an advisory vote, students
voted 704 yes to 697 no. The
ASUI senate voted 5-5 on the
matter, with Vice-President
Gerry Wright breaking the tie
in the affirmative.

The regents will also
consider a measure aimed at
slightly tightening rules
concerning class withdrawals.
If approved, the new policy
provides:—students may drop a class
anytime during the first four
weeks of a semester without
receiving a "W" on their
permanent records.—students may withdraw
from only 20 credits of classes
during their college careers.—those who wish to
withdraw from classes and
have reached the 20 credit

hmit may petition to the
petitions subcommittee of the
Council 'of Academic Deans.

The administration is asking
the regents to put all courses,
including those currently
designated as "extqnyion,"
under the same'cad'emic '

standards thus removing the
distinction between
"residence" and "extension"
courses.

If approved, courses
designated as extension will
be reevaluated by appropriate
academic'epartments and
approved as regular courses.

The end result could be
closer academic control over
U. of I. courses offered away
from campus.

Regent approval is also
asked for the following:—an updated U. of I. anti-
discrimination policy as well
as an updated affirmative
action pohcy.—an updated policy on
student records.—an amendment to the
ASUI constitution specifying
impeachment procedures for
elected officials. Students
approved the measure at the
polls two weeks ago.

Search for a physical plant director ended
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After dark, perspectives on the weather change, as evidenced

by this photo by Rick Steiner.

The search for a permanent
physical plant director has
been discontiunued due to
"financial uncertainty" of the
university and newness of
David L. McKinney to his
position as financial vice
president.

"The president terminated
the search entirely and the
committee has been
dismissed," said Dean Elmer
Raunio, head of the search
committee. As a result of
discussion between President
Richard Gibb and McKinney
concerning the impact of
Initiative One's passage on the
university the search was
halted, said Raunio.

McKinney also felt he wan-
ted more time to get to know
the operations of the physical
plant and the university as a
whole, said Raunio. The
physical plant director reports
activities to the financial vice
president. McKinney started
in his new position only six
weeks ago, leaving a position
as associate commissioner of
finance for the Indiana Com-
mission for Higher Education.

The search committee had
narrowed the selection of a
new director to four can-
didates. Since the decision to
postpone any final selection,
all candidates have been
notified, said Raunio.

The position became open
in the later part of August
when plant director George
'Gagon retired. Ed Stohs,

fill the position outside the
university, the search will start
over again, said Raunio. The
search would begin no earlier
than this spring, he said.

The position could be filled
from a promotion within the
university and still be in com-
pliance with Affirmative Ac-
tion policies, said Raunio.

nfidence vote
nnel policy

desire for more involvement
in any decisions to curtail or
cut academic programs.

The alternate proposal
defines "Financial exigency"
as "an imminent financial
crisis that threatens the sur-
vival of an institution or agen-
cy as a whole." The state
board office's definition
provided that individual
departments could suffer
financial crisis, opening the
way for each institution to be
"internally divided."

Tenured faculty, under the
faculty's guidelines, must be
given at least one year's notice
before the position is ter-
minated. Likewise, a tenured
professor should not be ter-
minated before a nontenured
faculty member, "except for
compelling reasons."

Alternatives to termination
were also suggested, including
early retirement and transfer
from full-time to part-time ser;.i,—

'continuedon page 2)

manager of plant engineering,
has been acting physical plant
director since that time. Stohs
was one of the approximately-
25 applicants for the per-
manent director position, said
Don Amos, business manager
and member of the dismissed
committee.

If the university decides to

Faculty gives co
to alternate perso

by Cary Hegreberg

In response to a personel
policy recently proposed by
the Office of the State Board
of Education, the University
of Idaho faculty Tuesday ap-
proved an alternate proposal
that would strengthen faculty
participation in dealing with
possible program reductions.

The faculty will present the
policy, for approval to the
Board of Regents at its
meeting next week. The
proposal received Faculty
Council approval before being
presented to the general
faculty.

The state board office's
proposal, fallout from one
percent initiative passage,
received criticism and op-
position from the university
staff and faculty because of
what were called inhumane
firing guidelines in the face of
budget reductions. Faculty
members also expressed a
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'Cedar Thief'ttracts controversy

sTUDENTs $1.00 DEC.7,8,9,10,14,15,16

"However, that was hardly
. KUID's fault. The station
sought out all the sides of the
story. Potlatch refused to give
its side. And that, a matter
solely up to Potlatch, was the
only reason the show did not
give both sides.

"But it wasn't any lack of
fairness that disturbed Little.
Any criticism at all of Little's
friends in places like Potlatch
is unacceptable to the latent
censor that lurks within
him...Little's suggestion of
legislative retaliation amounts
to a threat," Hall wrote.

Public television ap-
propriations go to many
things, said Art Hook,

KUID'eneralmanager. "I have
severe reservat'ions about
whether (the legislature)
should be in program control
or censorship. The ap-
propriations go for things over
and above the presentation of
one program whose content
(Little) may have some dif-
ferences with," Hook said.

"I'd be happy to show
"Cedar Thief" to anyone
who'd like to see it. We
haven't been contacted by any
group wanting to see it.

"We think the program is
fair and balanced. There's not
a fact in that program that can
be disputed," said Hook.

If Little is implying that the
legislature should censor
(continued from page 1)

Faculty votes to st
vice.

Some members of the
'American Federation of
Teachers felt the policy was
too general, and Alan Rose,
president of the Moscow
chapter, proposed a policy
further strengthening faculty
rights. Rose said the.
federation statements were
"stronger and clearer" than
the policy from Faculty Coun-
cil.

Dr. Siegfried Rolland,
professor of history,

pubhc television, Hook thmks
it's wrong.

Wendy Kastelic, KUID
public mformation director,
thinks showing the film to the
legislature is a wonderful
idea. We'd love to have
legislators look at this because
it's a fine piece of journalism.
It . got rave reviews. We'e
proud of it; it's a well-
produced work.

"We went through all the
steps to make sure the film
was legal. We had a lawyer
view it, and members of the
Forest Service. We figure if
there was any legal action that
could be taken against the
film, Potlatch would have
already done it," Kastelic said.

"If the film creates enough
furor to get the (scaling) laws
changed, that's what public
television is for," she said.

Little said the film is biased,
Kastelic said. But Little's
remarks have been taken out
of context. "He said it in a log
scaling committee meeting.
The minutes of the meeting
have not been published yet.
He hasn't contacted us—and
it would not be fair for us to
respond until we know exactly
what he said and the reasons
for it," she concluded.

"If there's any indication of
program control, we'l make
an effort to demonstrate that
that's inappropriate," said
Hook.

rengthen policy
questioned whether the
federation goals were
achievable and suggested the
faculty pursue "what is prac-
tically possible rather than
idealistic goals."

Rose, however argued
"There are certainly some
concessions here, I think it'
perfectly achievable and
realistic."

The faculty ultimately
voted to keep the Faculty
Council proposal basically in-
tact.

to> )) ~

by N. K. Hoffman
State Rep. Walter Little is

"leading a movement to
require that members of the
legislature see the KUID-TV
program "Cedar Thief" before
they vote on'ublic television
appropriations," Bill Hall,
editorial page editor of the
Lewiston Morning Tribune,
wrotai IIit 5'oiumn sundhy.

"The program was critical
of log scaling (measuring)
practices and didn't make
such timber giants as Potlatch
Corp. look good at all," wrote
Hall.
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Committee to study
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streamlining o
>inks

perations
by Kathy Bamard

UID

The ASUI SenateWed-
nesday night approved a
special ad hoc committee to

" . study streamlining ASUI
operations.

Senator Jim Wright, author
f, of the bill defined

"streamlining."
"Iwould assume that would

mean things like combining
, 'oards, things like cutting

down the members on a com-
,.It'-mittee, and things like just
f; getting rid of some boards en-
5'.. tirely," he said.

Senator Linda DeMeyer
agreed. "Often times the ap-

'ointments we make are
nothing more than warm

. bodies just sitting on the
board just so we don't lose the
positions. Anything we can do

't ~ to combine boards so we don'
have warm bodies just sitting
there doing nothing, I think, isg,~ a good idea."

An amendment to the
~'. "+original bill requires the com-

mittee, which Wright will
„:~chair, to submit its recom-

mendationsto the rest of the
senate by March, 1979.

The senators also approved
$800 compensation for the

, ~-ASUI legislative liaison. The
$800 is broken down to

~~- provide:

~150 per month for three
months for rent

~100 per month for three
months for food and—450 for three months of
correspondence expense.

Senator Scott Fehren-
bacher, who submitted the
bill, said, "As far as specifics, I
didn't think that the liaison
had to have that detailed of an
expense account, especially
the first year, when we really
don't know what he's going to
be running into."

The senators agreed the
liaison could ask for more
money later if he needed to.

In closing communications,
vice president Rick Howard
emphasized the responsibility
of each senator to support the
senate's decisions.

Quoting from, Robert 's

Rules of Order, he said,"After
the vote is announced, the
decision of the majority
becomes the decision of every
member of the organization,
and it is the duty of every
member to accept and abide
by this decision."

"My point is," he continued,
"that there were close votes
last time on some of these
resolutions. If you were one of
the dissenting votes, it is your
duty to voice the majority
decision."

L r
"'179" - "'179" - "'79"
CIVICS - WAGONS - ACCORDS-

ACCORD lX AND TIIE All
NEW 4-DOOR ACCORDS

IN STOCK NON AND READY
FOR DEI.IVERY

LENISTON CYCLE &
AUTO CENTER

2304 16th Ave,

Lewiston —743-6596

"Where Service Comes Before
And After The Sale"

..-Graduate exa
A review of basic math and

English concepts for in-
Q dividuals planning to take the

Graduate Record
Examination (GRE) will be

' "'iven on,Dec. 2.
Offered through the Univer-

. '~ sity of Idaho Office of Con-
tinuing Education, the math

"....review will cover arithmetic,
algebra, plane geometry, and
chart and graph concepts. In-
dividual instruction is offered.

The English review will

i.: cover concepts necessary for
handling vocabulary,
analogies, sentence com-

'W ~ pletion and reading com-
prehension.

Sample GRE test questions
will be given for each review
session. The math review will

be from 9:30 a.m. through

m scheduled
11:30 a.m. and the English
review will be from 1 to 3 p.m.
each day. Students need to at-
tend both sessions in order to
cover all the material. The
class will meet in room 328 of
the University Classroom Cen-
ter.

Michael Hardie, head of the
math and science department
at Pullman (Wash.) High
School, will teach the math
review. George Savage, U of I
English lecturer, will teach the
English review.

There will be a $ 12
registration fee for the math
or English review or $20 for
both. To pre-register or obtain
more information, contact the
U of I Office of Continuing
Education, 885-6486.

$IIAPIE EAPI78 BBGTlglGE
The foshion center for the style minded lody--o t prices

you con o fford.

Sizes 3-13

Butterfly Slo x-straight legged & cuffed only $18.00
Hooded Velours R Active Wear in Berry Colors now $22.00

Come give yourself o little luxury. You deserve it
with our dresses from New York, Colifornia, and

'exas.

(Jet going on the slopes with our SKI WEAR by
LIBERTY BELL ond PACIFIC TRRIL. Complete line of
socks, gloves, vest-or complete ski sets.

positions OI KN»ee ~SUI
Rll of this 8 more is brought to
you everydoy, mondoy thru
Saturdoy, 9-5:30, 'til 9:00

on Fridoy nites.

2 Senate seats
] Legislative Liaison

Applications can be picked

up in the ASUI office.

Deadline Dec. I, )87S

)I )II) ]I ~~ ~~)I) ]I c', ~

P) ~( Ic c0 g Ic
~ )

203 E. 3rd
(Behind Berg's)

882-2425
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Conditioned response
Financial exigency is the bell that makes people,

like Pavlov's dogs, salivate. In this case, the Office of
State Board of Education rang the bell, and the
faculty, via Faculty Council, has salivated.

The state board office has proposed a broadly
defined policy for faculty layoffs, while the faculty has
responded with a rather narrow policy. Faculty mem-
bers prefer to use tenure as a basis for deciding if a
faculty member is laid off, and suggested early
retirement or reduction from full-time to part-time
status as ways to alleviate the problem.

Faculty members are understandably concerned
about losing their jobs. No one, especially a tenured
professor, is enthusiastic about losing his or her job.

And, the faculty has proposed alternatives, as men-
tioned above, to alleviate the possible "financial
exigency" the 1 percent initiative may cause.

However, aspects of the possible exigency have
been ignored.

One aspect is that, in making tenure such an im-
portant part of the decision to retain a faculty mem-
ber, the university could lose some promising,
young —and untenured —professors. Such losses
would not benefit the university or the students. And
the students have at least as large a stake in
whether the university retains quality programs as do
professors and administrators.

Another point is that if tenure is not used as the
major criterion for retaining a professor, what will be
the criteria, and who will decide those criteria and set
the standards?

While it is commendable that the faculty has dared
to defend itself, the entire issue has other
ramifications which need to be examined.

L. Triemstra

jim bord

I stumbled across an old
friend of mine the other day.
Poor fellow looked terrible.
His face was long and drawn,
his eyes baggy, his hair
mussed and his clothes
wrinkled beyond recognition.
Now here, I thought, is a
dedicated student. The effort
he has put forth this semester
even shows on his face. Surely
in a desert of academic
procrastination, I thought, my
friend must be an oasis of ac-
complishment, considering his
haggard appearance.

"Really been hitting the
books, huh?" I asked him.
"Bet you'e doing well in all
your classes, right?"

"Well," he said, "it's like
this. Ever since I adopted this
new style of studentism, I
haven't been to classes," he
said with a yawn. The muscles
around his right eye twitched
spasmodically.

"But how can you do so well
and not go to classes," I
probed, intrigued.

"That's just it," he said. "I'm
not doing all that well. But my
new system allows me a kind
of academic freedom I'e
never had in my three years
here."

Academic freedom? That'

john hech

In a praiseworthy move last
week, U of I President
Richard Gibb demonstrated
his leadership and courage
when he announced student
fees would not be used to help
finance the proposed Varsity
Center.

This decision reversed a
direction which he has been
taking over the last year, one
of relying on student fees for
projects and services which
would not be forthcoming
from the legislature. Not only
is he holding a line on student
fees, but he might be able to
someday begin reducing
them.

It appears the greater op-
portunity Gibb has had to
study the issue of student fees,
the more sensitive he has
become to the complex
ethical and constitutional
questions involved in taxing
students when they attend
college.

. The passage of the One Per-
cent Initiative probably con-
tributed to underlining this
sensitivity. It gave some in-
dication of the mood of the
taxpayers in Idaho. Another
aspect was the negative reac-
tion, especially by the media,
of the approval of'he BSU
basketball pavilion, which is
to cost $ 14 million.

for me, I thought. "Pray,
elucidate," I urged him. "It'
like this," he said, taking out a
cigarette, dropping it then
retrieving it and lighting the
filter end. "I don't go to
classes. I don't do the assign-
ments. I don't even take the
tests. I just worry about it all.
No studying. Only worrying.
It's simple."

"If it's so simple," I asked,
"then why do you look so run-
down?"

"Oh, I was up until 2 o'lock
this morning worrying about a
big test in history today," he
said. "I worried more for this
test than I usually do. I really
feel pretty good about it."

"Well," I mused, "with all
this worrying going on, you
must not have too much time
for drinking and partying,
right?"

"Au contraire," he said.
"Partying helps me worry. It
reminds me of all the things
I'm supposed to be doing and
the fact that I'm not doing
them even though I...now,
what was I saying?" He drop-
ped his cigarette again. He
didn't notice.

"Tell me," I said. "How of-
ten do you worry?"

"Oh, in a good week I might

put in 20 to 24 hard hours of t
worrying, give or take a Q,
furrowed brow," he said, g

'hinkinghe had said
L

'omethingclever.
"Couldn't you just as well ~

be putting that time into

studying?" I asked. "After all,
you'e shelled out a busload
of money here on registration, '.
books and parking tickets,
haven't you?"

Yeah. Thanks for remin-

ding me though. Those are

some other things I need to
worry about "he said

"Well, what are you going
to do about finals?" I asked.

"Oh, I don't worry about
finals until dead week," he

said. "A time to worry about

everything and everything
worried about in its own time,

I always say; Besides, haven't I „
got enough to worry about
now?"

"I se'e," I said, looking at

him from the corner of my

eye. "Would you like to go get

a cup of coffee and discuss
this further?" I asked.

"No, I really shouldn'. I
need to go over to the library
to worry about a literature
term paper. Thanks, though,"
he said and walked away.

in a pig's eye
At that time it was

suggested Idaho legislators
might take a jaundiced view
of cries of financial agony
when expensive buildings
were constructed from univer-
sity funds or student fees,
usually the same thing. The
lesson was not lost on Gibb.

It seems unlikely the Board
of Regents will turn down a
plan, supported by both
students and administration,
which comes at very little cost
to the institution, either finan-
cially or politically, which
brings us a new building.

Football coach .Jerry
Davitch Wednesday evening
called the athletic facility
"critical" to his recruiting ef-
forts. He also said his
recruiting and personal ethics
are something he won't give
up for winning. He pointed
out the effect that jogging a
quarter-mile in the snow bet-
ween the Kibbie Dome had on
our players.

If we are fortunate with our
fundraising, we might have
the Varsity Center completed
in time for the 1980 football
season, 21 months away. Un-
fortunately for the coach, he
will probably'ot be able to
promise the potential players
any such completion date,

although it could happen.
A real test and question is

what will be the basis on which
the East End Facility is

presented to friends and alum-
ni. While a wellMesigned
facility is a symbol of the
generous impulses of its con-
tributors, and will be of great
use for the university com-
munity, it is not always
the "sexiest" donation which
might be given.

A challenge has been
passed on to the U of I Foun-
dation, which will be respon-
sible for coordinating the fun-
draising for the Varsity Cen-
ter. Current plans are for
respected alumni to assist in
the contact of other alumni
and friends.

In this contact process, will
there be more emphasis
'placed on the broad, student-
based aspect, or one which is
supportive of intercollegiate
athletics? If the latter, then
the Varsity Center can be con-
sidered a barometer of the
confidence the alumni hold
for the future of the Univer-
sity of Idaho and the role
which athletics has played
over the years establishing
warm memories of their
college days for our
graduates.

new style student



are any other football
programs, whose star players
have to pay their own way
through school.

The success of the program
not only attracts top quality

players, but according to
Macy, it makes better per-
formers out of the back-up
players.

"The back-up players have

: more incentive 'because they
are playing with top quality
players," offers Macy. "The
players are also more highly
developed. Since Davis is a
smaller school and doesn'

have a hundred scholarships
to hand out, the players
receive more individual at-

tention. The smaller number

of players turning out for the
team means the coaches have

to work harder at developing
a player's skills. At the big
schools, they look you over
and if you can't do what they
want, there's ten more guys
behind you."

One of the added benefits

of the Cal-Davis low-cost;
high-success program is nearly
universal support from the
students. Unlike many
colleges, where expensive and

less successful programs- are
under constant attack, a
disparaging word is rarely

heard on the Davis campus.
The students are happy
because they have an ex-

cellent football team at
minimal cost. The football

players are happy because

they play for a nationally
recognized team —even
though they pay their own

way. They play football
because they want to play, not
because they are paid to play.

It works for Jim Sochor, but

I don't think Bear Bryant

would believe it.

highly regarded schools in a
university system considered

by many to be the best in the
nation. The 16,000 student
enrollment is small enough, by
California standards, to at-

tract many students who are
disenchanted with the big city
life style, but big enough to
support a 'medical school, a
law school, and a school of
veterinary medicine, in ad-

dition to well developed
curricula in agriculture and

the liberal arts and sciences.
"There are two main

reasons why the Davis football

program is successful," says

Tom Macy, a former standout
football player and coach for
the Aggies. "First, the
program is low-key, you'e not

a semi-pro player, and second,

you get the best education
available."

Macy had every op-
portunity to evaluate the

Davis football program. He

played football for the Aggies

from 1969-72, earning all con-

ference honors three times for

his offensive line play. After

graduating, he coached under

Sochor for three years.
Like most standout college

football players, Macy was

highly recruited in high
school.

"When you come out of

high school, you feel like a

piece of meat —everybody
wants to take a bite to see

what it's like," he recalled.
"Sochor wasn't like that. He

kept telling me what a good
education I'd get. It was all

very low-key."
That Sochor's recruiting

technique works, is self-

evident. Not only is he

producing winning teams, he

ts attracting football players to

Davis that would otherwise be

going to the high-powered

football machines at major

colleges. Macy turned down

offers to play for Nebraska

and Whittier College, and

that's not unusual. According

to Macy, many of the Cal-

Davis players since 1971 have

turned down "full ride" offers.
"Dave Roberts played next

to me on the line for three

years. He was a Division II all

American, and he turned

down a full ride to USC,"

Macy stated.
Of course, the success the

Aggies have enjoyed makes

Sochor's job easier. It is a

well-known fact that suc-

cessful football programs per-

petuate themselves. But there

aren't many, if indeed there

by Steve McMullin
When the University of

California at Davis hosted
Lehigh University in the semi-

finals of the 1977 NCAA
Division II playoffs, it was

more than just a football game
between two of the nation's

best small college teams. It
was more than a battle of of-

fenses and defenses. It was a
meeting of opposite
philosophies.

Although Lehigh won the
contest 39-31, before a
national television audience,
Cal-Davis proved a point
which could have far-reaching
implications for college foot-
ball. That point is, you don'

have to spend a lot of money
to play good football. In fact,
the Aggies, who were un-

defeated going into the Lehigh

game, posted an 11-1 record
and finished the season
ranked third in the nation in

Division II despite the fact
that they spent less money on

their entire football program
than some large schools spend
transporting 'heir team to a

single game. Lehigh, although

not a big spender by major
college standards, spent much

more money on football than

Cal-Davis.
How Cal-Davis plays foot-

ball so inexpensively is really

quite simple —they do not of-

fer athletic scholarships. The

Aggies belong to the Far
Western Conference, a

California league that forbids

athletic scholarships. Besides

Cal-Davis, the conference in-

cludes Sacramento State,
Humboldt State, Chico State,

San Francisco State, and Cal

State Hayward.
Cal-Davis had dominated

the conference in football sin-

ce 1971,en route to becoming

a national power in Division

II. The real story in Davis

football is itt how that rise to

national power came to be.
There are two reasons,

really: head coach Jim Sochor

and the school itself. Sochor

took over a mediocre football

program in 1970, and by 1972

had the Aggies playing in their

first ever post-season game, an

encounter with Massachusetts

in the Boardwalk Bowl. The

turnaround was accomplished

partly because Sochor is an in-

telligent, innovative coach,

but largely because he is a

masterful recruiter. His

biggest selling point is the

school itself.
Cal-Davis is one of the most
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How Should

We Then Live?

The rise a'nd decline
of western thought

and culture by
Francis A. Schaeffer

available at

Crossroads
Bookstore

Washington & 3rd
Moscow

December hours:
9:30-6p.m., Mon.-Sat.

Open Fridays till 9 p m.

istin
lumni

a,will
hasis
dent-
ichis
giate
then
con-

5the
hold

>iver-
role

ayed
shing
their
our

9 g.mts - 6 p.m.
9 a.mts - 1 p.mts

at the

6 0$ I Fine Arts Gallery
(across from the Satel ite SUB)

Dec. 1
Dec. 2

Successful football at a bal gajfJ
Friday, Dec.1,1978 5

Morgans'lley

'5$» ptttt tteb 'NIlll» @n
Tiffany Lamps Stained Glass Windows

Austrailian Crystal Prise>
Jewelry Boxes Chnstmae

Decorations and Gift lte»
Lewiston, ID B35p'I I2PB) 746-2445

.l r ~I
Harvest Moon Restaurant

pa1ouse, 1vVash.
BBQ Ribs

Or
Eggplant Parmigiana

eidel
abel Vogt

Heaven"

Servln

Fri;: Josh Y
Sig & M

Sun.: Hog

Srs-1829 Hours: 5:30-9

i
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1I ie Argonau]l
Wants Youl

We are accepting
applications for editors
reporters feature writers

and advertising.

Come to the Arg. office in the
basement of the SUB or call

885-6371

DAII Y SPECIALS tl2.44 Ii UP

Lewiston 'OSCOW Pullman
132main '109 W 6th 207 Main t
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I Complete Line ol Marlin Products
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Auto Glass ~ Store Fronts
1,

Glass Board-Up Service Glass Board-Up Service

Tub Enclosure
i Mirrors ~ Aluminum Windows, . ~Q Tracto'abs I

ShowerOoors ~ RatloOoors —.~~~ . InsulatedGlass
fireplace Enclosures, . 'ommercial 8 Residential 1

All Glass Service

882-3543
t ~ E Nh Sl Attar rtours'S N2~S or 882-5037 Moscow Id~
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both nights are $6, $5 and $4
for non-students, $3 for
college students

all that jazz
Tickets will be available at the
door for $1.50. Proceeds will

go towards instruments, recor-
ds, music and audio equip-
ment.

Other groups performing
will be WSU's Jazz Bands I
and II and the U of I Faculty
Quartet. The marathon is join-
tly sponsored by KUOI FM
and MENC (Music Educators
National Conference.)

ers join for recital
professor Wtlham Btlhngsley

Lynn McMurphy and Bryce
Hamilton will give a joint
junior recital on Tuesday,
Dec. 5 at 4 p.m. in the School
of Music Recital Hall.

McMurphy will sing I Lie
Awake and Listen, from the
opera Carry Nation, by
Douglas Moore and an
English set by twentieth cen-
tury composer Jean Berger.
Hamilton, who plays guitar,
will perform Sir Pavanes by
Luis Milan, a French baroque
suite by Robert de Visee and
three pieces by Heitor <ittx-
Lobos.

Both recitals are free and
open to the public.

The Ballet Folk Company
of Moscow and the
Washington-Idaho Symphony
Orchestra will present
Tschaikowsky's "The Nut-
cracker" at 8 p.m. in the
Washington State University
coliseum theatre Monday and
Tuesday Dec. 11 and 12.

The first performance of
the traditional Christmas
ballet is sponsored by the
WSU-Pullman Artist Series,
the second by the coliseum.

-Admission- to the Monday
concert is by Artist Series
season ticket or single ad-

mission Single admission only
is available for the Tuesday
performance. Ticket prices

Big bands and
Such Jazz greats as the

University of Idaho Jazz Ban-
ds I, II and III, WSU's Jazz
Combo and the U of I Trom-
bone Quartet will perform at
the third annual Jazz
Marathon tonight in the SUB
Ballroom.

The bands begin the
beguine at 7 p.m. and will
swing until midnight. Advance
tickets are $1 and can be pur-
chased at the School of Music.

Ensemble and singSPECIAL ALL 7

LOCATIONS~
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An Anton Bruckner mass

and selections from the opera
Carry Nation are scheduled to
be performed at concerts by
the University of Idaho Wind
Ensemble and Chamber
Singers and a joint junior
recital.

The Bruckner "Mass in E
Minor" will be presented
Thursday, Dec. 7 at 8 p.m. in
the Adtninistration Building
Auditorium. Dr. Robert
Spevacek will conduct the
Wind Ensemble and Chamber
Singers in this concert.

The combined groups. will
also perform Ritmo Jondo by
Carlos Surinach, Inaug ural
Fanfare by Aaron Copland
and Ramasha by U of I music

pit r
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Recap Radial Ply
Snow Tires Commercial

Traction
RecapsAR 78.13

BR 78.13
CR 78.13
CR 78.14
ER TB-14
FR 78-14
GR 78.14
HR 78-14
AR 78.15
GR T8-15
HR 78-15
JR 78.15
LR 78-15
Att 70 series $3.00extra
Plus 95'ET and like Size Recappable Casing

20.95
22.95
22.95
23.95
25.95
28.95
28.95
29.95
25.95
28.95
30.95
31.95
33.95

23.95
24.95
28.95
31.95.
38.95
41.95
44.95
47.95

650-16
700-15
750-16
750-17
800-16.5
875-16.5
950-16.5
1000-16.5
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~Robe eShirt
~Pillow eJacket
~Bedspread IoggingSuit

Use

Fur-Flannel-Velour

Complete
Grum Brake $6995
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!)29.20
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Installation Available

Heavy Nuty

, cash tL $+95
,

Carry
- Installabon Available

a oad
Levelers

cash tt carry

Fort, 29

rz9

~~ ~ NSTUDS
'7 per Tire

RIMS
$12.95

with
purchase of

snow tire

Plus
Assorted
Fabrics

'8

B 78.13
0 78.13
C 78-14
E 78.14
F 78-14
G 78-14
H78 14
A 78-15
G 78.15
H 78.15
J 78.15
L 78-15

I 9.(5
19.95
19.95
20.95
21.95
22.95
18.95
20.95
21.95
22.95

5

lrtstanalion Avattartte
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~s ~ s44"
Moat ~«Rantupa

Christmas Hours:~
9-8 p.m. fTlon.-F ri.
9-6 p.m. Soturdog.
12-.4 Su'ndog

22.9

Alt TO seaes $3.00extra
Plus 95'ET ene hke stze.Recappable casing

Dex Bailey Tire
And Service Centers

Moscow

Phone
882-3725

5th 8 main
882-Z >2

Traditional Christmas ballet set
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When Jack Nicholson heard
the Fox Theatre at Los
Angeles had booked The Bat-
tle of Chile for a two day
engagement, he told a film

seminar group he was

teaching at Southern Cal. to
"get off your butts and go see
that film! We'e going to study

nothing else this term except
what Guzman (the director)
and what his people filmed

down-there during the take-

over. I'm sure we'l be real

busy trying to figure out what

in the hell he was doing and

just how he 'did what he did

with one hand-held (camera)
and a Nagra (recorder)."

Nicholson was right about
the power and importance of
this documentary on the even-

ts which led to the fall of
Salvador Allende in 1973.

The Film Society will

present this politically im-

perative film Sunday in the

Borah Theatre. There are

three show times, 1, 4:30and 8

p m. There will be a ten-

minute intermission between

parts one and two.
Admiss'ion is $2 or by Film

Society pass.
The Battle of Chile is a film

essay on the people of Chile

and their nation where the

possibility of real revolution

exists. As the film begins,

Allende has been in office two

years and has been trying to
reorganize the society and

move it toward socialism

within the framework of a

democratic government. He is

on very shaky ground in his ef-

forts to nationalize industry

because of financial and in-

dustrial embargoes set up by

the United States and other

foreign democracies.
The country begins to star-

ve from economic deprivation

but Allende stays on and

mobilizes the masses at a huge

rally in Santiago. At the end of

his amazing speech for

solidarity among the workers

and peasants, he calls out,

"Jump if you'e nota Fascist!"

and half a million people

jump. It's a staggering sight

and what a way to finish a

speech.
After witnessing a film so

absorbing as The Bat tie of
Chile, I begin to feel that

making a film with actors,

make-up, costumes and

dialogues written by some

gnome hiding out in the

sewers of the Los Angeles

River with his typewriter, is a

sham. This film is reality/ We

see the faces of the Chileans in

human interest terms —the

speeches, the bloody and

violent street fights and the

parades with workers chan-

ting funny, dirty rhyming

slogans.
But Allende's government

can't defend itself against the

American industrialist em-

bargo, even though the

workers and peasants make

extraordinary efforts to keep

the country going. The coun-

try begins to split open before

our eyes as the violence
escalates while Allende sup-

porters in the Presidential
Palace argue whether they
should be armed or not when

the final siege comes.
Step by step, all the way to

its grizzly finale, the film

shows that only through the

covert intervention of the

CIA, ITT, Exxon and other
corporate giants of the
democratic persuasion, did

this deadly coup d'tat come

to pass. Chile is set up as a
model failure of socialism in

the western hemisphere.
For the makers of this film,

The Battle of Chile was an ex-

tremely dangerous and in-

tense experience. One camera
man was killed outright as he

filmed a street battle in San-

tiago; two other members of
the film crew were arrested by

the Chilean Secret Service
and have never been heard
from since.

The film itself was cut into
small pieces and smuggled out
of Chile. It was reassembled
and edited in Cuba at the
prestigious Institute de
Cinema.

As we have the film for only
one day, only 600 people will

be able to see this movie over
the three show times of 1, 4:30
and 8 p m. in the Borah
Theatre. The Film Society
urges you to come to orie of
the early shows since the 8

p.m. show may be sold out.

Tavern offers wide variety of bands

A bevy of bands will

descend upon Washboard
Willie's Tavern beginning
tonight with Salt Creek, a hot

country group from Spokane.
The tavern is located at

Pullman on Main Street.
Sunday, the rock and roll

band "Raven" will perform

one night only. The main

feature at Willie's will be
Vassar Clements. He will give

two concerts Monday at 8 and

10:30p.m.

Steel guitOarist per
The Coffeehouse will

present Robbie Basho, a con-

cert steel string guitarist, in

the SUB. Ballroom Saturday

night at 8. Admission is free.

Advance tickets for
Clemen's performances are on
sale at the Magic Mushroom

at Moscow and Budget Tapes
and Records at Pullman.
Tickets are $4.50 in advance
and $5.50 the day of the show.

Beginning Tuesday, Dec. 5

and playing through Saturday
the country rock group will be
Buffalo Rose. Persons at-

tending must be at least 21

years old.

forms in ballroom
Basho blends the styles of

Hindu raga's and American

Indian music as well as con-

temporary guitar. He is also a

poet and incorporates his free

form poetry into his music.

Album advance
KUOI-FM 89.3MHz "Preview 78,"ni'ghtly at 10:05.

Friday —The Clash, "Give 'Em Enough Rope"

Saturday —Vangelis, "Beaubourg"

Sunday —Peter Tosh, "Bush Doctor"

Monday —Geoff Muldaur and Amos Garrett

Tuesday —Central Avenue
Blues'ednesday—Air, "Montreaux Swiss Air"

Thursday —Ducks Deluxe, "Don't Mind Rockin'onite"

*Made possible by the Gramophone
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Band For The Week. ~ .
"Salt Creek"

Sunday, Dec. 3 at 8:00p.m.
"Flurie" Concert
(a Rock 'n Roll Band
from San Francisco)

E. 215 Main, Pullman; (509) 332-3291
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Latest Styles From California
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Illustrated
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Crossroads Bookstore
Washington 8I, Third, Moscow

New December hours 9:30-6p.m., Mon.-Sat.
Open Friday nights till 9 p.m.

Thinking Classical?...Think KUID-FM
"The Afternoon Concert"

4 p.m. Monday Through Saturday

"Sundays Are Special"
Classical Music From 1 p.m. to 7 p.m.

8 Friday, Dec. 1, 1978

LUST
"You have heard that it .was

i,said, 'Do not commit adultery.'ut
I tell you that anyone who looks at I

a woman lustBally has already i,
committed adultery with her in his i

heart."
. The Lord Jesus i

Syeaking in Matt. 5:%7H XS.
iiSyonsored by .

" Faith Fellomshiyr'~ ~~~~
4%% ..

Led by Don Newman's 29
points and Reed Jaussi's 10
rebounds, Idaho men's basket-
ball opened a eight point first
half lead and never fell behind
Tuesday night when they beat
Whitworth College 81-69 in
Spokane.

The win puts Idaho at 1-1,
not including an exhibition
win over the Australian
Nationals Nov. 13.Tonight the
Vandals play host to Great
Falls College of Montana at
7 35 p m. in the Dome
following the women's game
at 5:30, while Saturday night
the University of British
Columbia visits the Dome at
the same time.

Whitworth's Rich Miller
and Earnest Lawrence kept

the home team close the first
half with fine shooting from
the field, and closed the half
with their team 'trailing by
three. But the pair cooled in
the second half and Newman
took over.

"We didn't have
any continuity," said Idaho
coach, 'Deadly'on Mon-
son, "until the second half
when Newman took over and
got the close-in shots and lots
of free throws. His leadership
is the difference out there."

Also in the scoring for
Idaho was Jaussi with 12 poin-
ts, and Jeff Brudie and Terry
Gredler with 11 each. Miller
and Lawrence finished with16
and 11 respectively for Whit-
worth.

Myhlebusi's
IP(inter

Speeials
One Group

Of Winter Jackets
And

Top Coats
50% Off

P. R..C: %1lSI.S
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It's guard against guard at Thursday's practice as Newman's
drive sets up a play on Ted Strugar. Photo by Hugh Lentz.

Netters post win Tuesday;
two home games next

NEWMAN
'New

Spirit,-'y

Marty Renzhofer
There's a new spirit around

the basketball court this year
at Idaho. The feeling around
campus is that Idaho could
have its first winning team sin-
ce 1971.And the big reason is
Idaho's newest addition,
Donald Newman.

Standing in at 6-3 and 190
pounds, Newman has
assumed, by setting an exam-
ple, the leadership of the Van-
dal men's squad this year."I'e been playing guard
ever since I'e started playing
basketball," he said. "And I
used to like to score
points, but when I started
going to high school, I
realized that a guard has to be
a leader. I have to get the
other guys hitting their string
before I can get mine."

And get his points he has. In
the two games Newman has
played for the Vandals, he has
scored 51 points. He had to sit
out the Minnesota contest
because of a game he played
in Lewiston this summer that
wasn't sanctioned by the
NCAA.

Don Newman

Newman comes from the
colorful city of New Orleans.
The middle son of Mr. and
Mrs. Robert Newman, Don
isn't the only one in the family
to have an athletic
background. His father played
a year and a half of major
league baseball before a
shoulder injury shortened hts
career.

Newman's older brother
Bob is the captain of Gram-
bling University's baseball
team and is expected to go in
the baseball draf t. His
younger brother, Carl, is a
sophomore in high school,
and according to. Don,'He'
just excellent. Carl has a good
future ahead of him."
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SOMETHING FOR

EVERYONE
Midnight Nov. 30-Dec 2

THE CHEERLEADERS
Dec. 3-6, 7.005 9:45
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Newman has been playing
ball since he was four. He
credits his skill to the desire
he has for the game. When
you see him play, you can tell
he puts a lot of effort and
pride into his game. The
player's style of basketball is
important to him. That's why
Don left Louisiana State
University for Idaho even
though he started there as a
freshman.

"I had what I considered a
good year at LSU. But the
coaches and other people star-
ted discouraging the type of
ball I wanted to play. They
said I was young and they
wanted to change the way I
played.

"That's when I decided to
leave. I had been to Moscow
and liked the area, so I
decided that Idaho would be
the best place to show how I
can play."

Don 'also thinks that coach
Don Monson is the best thing
to happen to Idaho.

"He builds character in a
person. Coach Monson makes
it known what you have to do
to be a winner. I can see the
improvement in all of us in
just the few practices and
games we'e played so far," he
said. "Monson is exactly what
Idaho needs. He makes you
want to work."

Pro-ball is definitely in
Don Newman's plans for the
future. He said that he wants it
and expects nothing less.
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Women open season tonight
Warm-up games before men's basketball this weekend will see

the Idaho women's team challenging Northern Montana tonight
at 5:30,and the championship men's intramural 3-man basketball
game Saturday at 6:15p.m. Both games are in the Kibbie Dome.

Tara Van Derveer's cagers officially open their 1978 season
today and hope to turn in a better performance than their 75-50
exhibition loss to the Australian Nattonals, played Nov. 13."We'e capable of playing better ball than we did," she said. "I
saw some very good individual skills that we still have to work in-
to a team effort."

Saturday's intramural game culminates play that began Oct.
31. It replaces the previously scheduled ASUI Senate vs. the
Idaho Administration match.

39million in uniform since 1 776
Since the Revolutionary Not all veterans are ex-

War, nearly 39 million men servicemen~ome 620,000 or
and women have served on ac- two percent of the veterans
tive duty in the U.S.military. population are women.

Friday, Dec. 1, 1

Put It On A T-Shirt
Put It On A Jacket

Express Yourself In Hundreds
Of Different Ways

Personalized Sportswear Is A Great
Christmas Gift

-"ie:.l ac <mar ~e resen s-
The Great Christmas "Put On"

Ie

.

9
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+ +
HASH

++ Christmas Trees +
+ FreshTrees Make +
++ AMoreBeautiful +

Christrnasl

We Stock Everything From T-Shirts To Heavy Winter
Coats All At The Low, Low Btackmarket Price.

Children's Sizes Also Available

FREE Blackmarket T-Shirt With Any $10 Order.

+, I I 6
+

+++ +
+ Visit Our Sales +
+ Lots. Now Open. ++
++ Latah County

+
Fairgrounds, +

+ Moscow Mall, ++

~Large Trees
~Wreaths
~Boughs
~Professional

Flocking

+ "YouGetMore Than ++
+ You'd Expect From +

Hash Co."

882-7844 +

During The Great Christmas "Put On"
Dec. 1st-20th

,'I ~ l i~ i I l I'I i ~

-Basement of the SUB-
885-6484
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Indian remains to be reburied Events
The Coiville Confederated

Tribes last week 'presented a
check for $14,533.20 to the
University of Idaho for
osteometric analysis and
reburial of the skeletal
remains of 150 Indians ex-
cavated during the con-
struction of Grand Coulee
Dam in 1939and 1940.

At a Spokane news con-
ference, Andy Joseph, chair-
man of the Plannmg Com-
mittee of the Colville Con-
federated Tribes Business
Council, said, "We are ex-
tremely anxious to have the

archeological research done
by the U of I so that these
members of the Colville Con-
federated Tribes and the
Spokane Tribe may be
reburied in our ancestral.
burial grounds at Inchelium."

Joseph said, "It has been an
insult to our people to have
the remains of our ancestors
stored unceremoniously at the
Eastern Washington State
Historical Museum where
they were placed by the
Bureau of Reclamation
following their exhumation in
1939 and 1940. In 1975 the

S:4:::.'AC:4AG:4S

i n McCall
this season?

Don't forget
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I:ilCCall

museum forwarded the
remains to the Laboratory of
Anthropology of the U of I for
future study and analysis. The
University of Idaho has had a
long and productive research
interest in the history of
peoples living along the
Columbia River and their
work would be compatible
with previous and on-going
research objectives."

According to Joseph, the
university, under the direction
of Dr. Roderick Spraque of
the university's laboratory of
anthropology, submitted a
request to the U.S. Bureau of
Reclamation for funding to
accomplish the necessary
osteometric research and
reburial of the remains. The
proposal was rejected by the
Bureau, and subsequently the
Colville Confederated Tribes
voted to fund the research and
reburial so that these skeletal
remains may be reburied with
"dignity."

4pplications
for senate open

Applications for two ASUI
Senate seats and tne
legislative liaison position are
available in the ASUI office in
the SUB.

Applicants must be mem-
bers of the ASUI. Ap-
plications are due Friday,
Dec. 8.

The senate appointments
are for one semester only and
the legislative position is only
for the 1979 legislative session
in Boise.

Friday, Dec. 1...
...Third Annual Jazz Marathon in the SUB Ballroom from 7 p.m. to mid-

night, Admission $1 in advance from the School of Music or $1.50 at the

door.
...Society of Professional Journalists will meet at 4 p.m. in the basement of
the Garden Lounge to discuss the upcoming Christmas party and guest

speakers.
...International Gift Fair sponsored by WSU's YWCA will be held in the

CUB Junior BaHroom from 9 a.m. to 9 p.m. Friday and Saturday.
..4,Talent —No Talent Show will be held in the Administration Auditorium

beginning at 7 p.m. Sponsored by Campus Crusade for Christ,

Saturday, Dec. 2...
...Friends Unlimited will sponsor the movie My Friend Flicka at the Micro
Movie House. The movie will show at 2 p,m. and admission is

free.'.Prom

Russia With Love will show at 7 and 9 p.m. in the Borah Theatre.
Admission is $1.25.Sponsored by SUB Films.
...Coffee House presents Robbie Basho at 8 p.m. in the SUB Ballroom. Ad-

mission is free.

'unday, Dec. 3...
...The Battle of Chile will show at 1, 4:30 and 8 p.m. in the Borah Theatre.
Admission is $2 and the film is sponsored by Film Society.
...Wesley Foundation Fellowship will meet from 5-7 p.m. at the First United

Methodist Church. Dr. Stan Thomas will be guest speaker on the topic
"Guyana and Its Implications."
...Seekers will meet at 7:30p.m. in the First Presbyterian Church to discuss
"Where in the World Will You Be?"with bible study in the book of Esther
and information on 1980Around the World Seeker Quest.
...Annual Marching Band and Vandalette Banquet at 6 p.m. in the SUB
Ballroom.

Monday, Dec. 4...
...UNICEF Christmas cards go on sale for one day only at the SUB from 10
a.m. to 5 p.m. 20 cards for $5.Half of the cost goes to UNICEF.
...The Palouse Group of the Sierra Club will be selling the Sierra Club calen-
dar from 11:30a.m. to 1:30p.m. at the SUB. Sales go to support the Sierra
Club's ecological activities.

Tuesday, Dec. 5...
..."Orestes, Messenger of Freedom —A Sartrean View," will be presented by
professor Georgia Shurr at 7:30p.m. in Administration Building room 318.
Free lecture sponsored by the classics honorary Eta Sigma Phi.
...Moscow Toastmasters will have a dinner meeting at Johnnie's Cafe begin-
ning at 6:15p.m. Officers will be nominated.

Upcoming...
...Aslide show about a 175 mile ski trek across the Idaho primitive area will

be shown next Friday at 7:30p.m. in the Galena Room. Ron Watters, author
of Ski Trails and Old Timers Tales in Idaho and Montana will present the
show. Sponsored by the Outdoor Programs.

HELP FOR SANTA SPECIALS!
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ROSSIGNOL CHALLENGER SKIS R
SALOMON 222 BINDINGS
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$181.95 ................SPECIAL 139

HEXCEL INVITATION SKIS tk
SALOMON 222 BINDINGS

REG.
$229.95 ................SPECIAL 169
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Plus ... Ski Clothing and Ski Fashions by Ski Levi, Skyr, Beconta,
Woolrich & North Face e group asst. -'/3 off
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NORTHWESTERN MOUNTAIN SPORTS
10 AM to 5:30PM, Monday-Saturday
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5. TRAILERS FOR SALE
Self contained travel trailer. Fully

skirted on large lot near campus.
$3500. See at Stadium Drive, Trailer
Court No. 48.

6. ROOMMATES
Roommate wanted Io share duplex.
Unfurnished. After 5 p.m. 882-2971,
interview.

Roommate wanted. 2 bedroom,
$91.50a month. Call 885-6371. ask
for Marten Renzhofer or leave
message.

7. JOBS
Addressers wanted immediately!
Work at home —no experience
necessary —excellent pay. Write
American Service; 8350 Park Lane,
Suite 127, Dallas, TX 75231

8. FOR SALE
Yamaha Fiberglass skies with Tyrolia
Bindings, 190 cm. $70. Henke boots
size 8 and 7, $40 each pair. Call
Claudia or Dawn, 885-6983.

LABRADOR RETRIEVER PUPPIES.
Black $20., Golden $30. Series of 2
DHL vaccinations and worming
included. Call Dan at 882-7530.

Buying a stereo? Stone Ground
Sound Sells the finest equipment for
hundreds less! B.I.C., Onkyo,
Technics, Philips, Sonus, and 90
more. Many components in stock.
November special: Technics SA-300
Receiver (35 W/CH) List: $300. Now
$210. Call 882-7769 anytime for
information.

Set of four rims for Ford pickup. They
are standard black and eight inches
wide. Call 882-6196 evenings or
weekends. $45.

9. AUTOS
1974 Ford Courier, Iop notch
condition, many extras, canopy shell.
Call Joe ingoom 304 at 885-7511 or
7482 evenings.

'77 Honda Accord for sale. Front
wheel drive,. 5 speed, steel belted
radials, excellent condition, $4000.
882-1094 or 885-6371, ask for
Diane.

12. WANTED
Students interested in teaching and
business. Distributive Education has
more job openings than graduating
teachers! Contact John Ho[up Ed.
21 2-C, 885-6556.

13. PERSONALS
Congratulations Io C.C. for winning
her first pool game.

See our domestic and imported Wine
Shop...Puff 'n Stuff, Inc., 610 1/2
Main, (next to Bonanza 88) Lewiston, .

ID, 746-9641.
I

Audio equipment discounted 10-40
percent off list. Most brands
represented. For quotes, call 882-
6567.

Hair removal is easy with electrolysis
for a lovelier you. Late and Saturday
appointments available. Call Lewiston
Electrolysis, 743-0965.

14. ANNOUNCEMENTS
Order Christmas trees now for that
special decor: Wreaths, boughs,
professional flocking. Delivery. All

available now. Hash Co., 882-7844.

Appreciated i[a Thoughtful Gifts...

Fine tools 8 paraphernalia
for fiber work.

Gift certificates for

yarns, accessories and

classes.
Handcrafted original
g[[[s.

tl QIQUJ QP IAMr$

203 S. JACKSON, MOSCOW, iDAHO 85845

(208) 882-6479
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County workshop offered
The Bedder Place has it all. Your one
stop waterbed shop is Comfort Zone
serving LaGrande, Kennewick and
Lewiston at 1102 Main, 746-9888.

Berserkly Records and Tapes and
Budget Tapes and Records brings
you Greg Klhn "Next of Kihn"
available on B-track, cassette and LP.
Only $4.97.

16. LOST AND FOUND
If you found my wallet in the library
Tuesday, Nov. 28, please return it. No
questions asked. Mare 882-2902.

17. MISCELLANEOUS
4 Ford 11"x 15" rims with Iru-tracs.
Rims in excellent shape; tires in used
condition. Phone 885-0921 after
5:00.($100)

Improve your grades
Send $1.00 for your 256-page, mail
order catalog of Collegiate Research.
10,250-B, Los Angeles, Calif. 90024.
(213)477-8226.

Newly elected Idaho county
officials will be offered in-
formation to help them in
their new jobs at a special
workshop prepared by the U
of I Bureau of Public Affairs
Research.

Offered in cooperation with
the Idaho Association of
Counties, the workshop is
designed to acquaint newly
elected and less experienced
county officials with the
responsibilities of their new
jobs and provide them with
basic knowledge and skills in
county budgeting and finan-
cial reporting and auditing.

The workshop will be given
at three locations, at Boise
State University Dec. 7; at
Idaho State University Dec.
14; and at the U of I Dec. 20.
The sessions will run from 9

a.m. until 4:30 p.m. and all
will be conducted, in the
Student Union Buildings- of
each campus.

There will be, no
registration fee. The
workshop is . being made
possible by a grant from
Program IMPACT under Title
I of the Higher Education Act
of 1965. The U.S. Office of
Education grant is being ad-
ministered by the Idaho Post-
secondary Education Com-
mission.
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at the
"We Care"

people's used
selection

78 Datsun B210
?6 Olds Starfire
74 Plymouth Duster
74 Vega hatchback
74 Pinto wgn.
?3Toyota Corolla
?2 Ford Galaxie

2-door
71 Datsun 1200

coupe
69 Dodge Polara
69 VW station wgn.
69 Toyota 4-door

$3995
$3?95
$2495
$1495
$1995
$2195

$1095

$1295
$995
$995
$995

Trucks:
?'7 Dodge Powerwgn

3/4 ton
?7 Chev. G-20 van
?6Datsun pickup

6t camper
?2 Datsun pickup
?2 Chev. campervan

'9

Dodge 3/4 Ion
4x4

63 International
Scout

$6195
$5695

$4495
$1795
$2695

$2195

$995

moscow
DATSUN

922 Troy Rd. 882-0540

By The New
Moscow Mall

E
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+ SUB Films Presents

++Froaai RN$ $1s
~'ith Love
Starring James Bond

Saturday Dec. X
Borah Theatre
4:30,7&9y.m.
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Continuing Education, Ag College offer special courses
Winter session, which oc-

curs during the break between
fall and spring semesters, is
planned for Dec. 26 to Jan. 12
this year.

Classes may be taken for up
to three semester hours credit.
Those who are interested
should contact the U of I Of-
fice of Continuing Education,
885-6486, now.

In the past, such classes as
digital computer program-
ming and fundamentals of
speech have proved to be
popular, although it is possible
to arrange for others if enough
interest is shown. Classes meet
for three hours a day for two
or three weeks, depending on
the number of credits the class
carries. Classes normally do
not meet on New Year's day.

A minimum of 12 students
is required for a class to be of-
fered, but directed study or
other individual study
programs may be arranged.
The Continuing Education Of-
fice has a form prepared
giving. advice on how to make
arrangements for such
programs.

Farmers, pesticide ap-
plicators and agribusiness

representatives are being
urged to register for the
University of Idaho's 1979
Plant Protection Seminar. The
short-course will be Jan. 3-5
on the Moscow campus.

Early registration is ad-
visable, according to Gene P.
Carpenter and Richard E. Oh-
ms, U of I College of
Agriculture faculty members
who are serving as co-
chairmen of the three-day
seminar.

New techniques and
procedures for the control of
weeds, plant diseases and in-
sect pests will be presented at
the seminar.

Regulations of the En-
vironmental Protection Agen-
cy and legal problems
associated with pesticide use
will be explained by Donald
A. Donaldson, Seattle, Wash.,
an EPA official.

Methods of identifying and
controlling plant diseases will
be surveyed by. U of I plant
pathologists Harry Fenwick,
Moscow, and Robert L. For-
ster, Kimberly.

Approved techniques for
applying pesticides will be
reviewed by Charles L. Peter-

Student Financial Aid Of-
fice at the University of Idaho
will not be able to fund a full-
time summer work-study
program, nor will part-time
work-study positions and
awards from loan and grant
funds be sufficient to help all
needy summer school studen-
ts, according to Dan Goyette
of the financial aid office on
campus.

Goyette blamed heavy

demand for fall and spring
student financial aid as reason
for the fund shortage this year
as well as last year.

He said, however, that ap-
plications for available funds
may be picked up at the finan-
cial aid office, UCC 228,
beginning Dec. 4. He added
the deadline for completed
application files is April 2,
1979 and that late applicants
will have little chance of
receiving assistance.

Work study funds scarce

son, U of I professor of
agricultural engineering.

L.E. Warren, Davis, Calif.,
regional technical specialist
for Dow Chemical, will ex-
plain application techniques
that minimize drift of
pesticides.

A special ground school for
private pilots is planned by
University of Idaho Office of
Continuing Education for
each Tuesd'ay evening from
Jan. 23 through April 24.

Early pre-registration with
the Office of Continuing
Education, 885-6486, is

nece'ssary, as class size is
limited.

The course, taught by Mel
Hirschi, a former U.S. Navy
flight instructor who holds a
commercial pilot's license,
will consist of 36 hours of
basic aeronautical instruction.

Students completing the
class. should have sufficient
knowledge to pass the written
portion of the FAA private
pilot certification test.

The basic texts, Pilot's Han-
dbook of Aeronautical
Knowledge and the Pri vate

Pilot-Airplane Written Test
Guide, will be included in the
$48 registration fee.

Students will have to have
an E 6 B computer or in-
,structor-approved equivalent.
A plotter will also be required.
Arrangements to purchase the
equipment may be made
during the first class session.
The approximate cost of new
equipment is $20.

Class meetings will be from
7 to 10 p.m. each Tuesday,
Jan. 23 through April 24, in

room 103 of the University
Classroom Center.
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This Year ~ ~ ~ INSTEAD Of "Fad" Items-
Broken, Out Of Batteries, Or Disused By New Year's ~ ~ ~

Make lt Music!
Our $519*System Gives Most People

Everything They'l Ever Want In A Stereo, ln
Features And Total Sound!

winterize.

What do you really want in a stereo system'? Isn't it just this: the best possible
reproduction of music, from records and radio, at the lowest possible price? Then this
system merits your careful consideration.

The key to its exceptional musicality is the new Advent/1 loudspeaker. It has the same
amazingly accurate tonal balance, extended high frequency response and power handling
ability as the larger, best-selling Advent Loudspeaker. In fact, it comes within a half octave of
matching the bass performance'of its big brother, at a far lower price!

But great speakers are not the whole story. This system is powered by the Yamaha
CR220 am/fm stereo receiver, with all the quality and features we'e come to expect from
Yamaha. Its craftsmanship, low distortion and reliability match those of the biggest, most
expensive Yamaha models.

The natural completion of System 519 is the new Garrard GT 25P semiautomatic
.turntable. Its simplicity and elegant styling place it far ahead of all competitors. Particularly
important is its low tonearm mass, which imposes no limitations on the wide-range Ortofon
FF 1 5E cartridge.

'Including our "Blue Chip System Warranty.
Just $85.47 down. $21.95s monthl Cash price with fax $545.47-Down Payment $85.47-'4

Monthly Payments $21.95-Total Deferred Price $612.27-Annual Percentage Rate 12%-
Upon Approval of Credit-insurance, lf Desired, Extra.

~ t ~ i

Store Hours
10s.m.-8 p.m.

I (Closed Sundays)
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